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 :ملخص البحث
جدفال  عدةفو خاح دا ت دد    يهدف  ذد ا احث دل  حدا ف افدو  "هدخر  اي د   ةدا  خايدو اح "دخ    

.  ث ل اح خايو خضع احتاس ةا  فيتو عةفو احخاقةو ةدا احجد ا اح د احا  دي احدي ي 4102ةا 
خ   ددفل  ددي  ج خ ددو  ددي احتدداس يأنفددخي  نددا "ت"فددهر  الفددياف  خي د ددخي اح فيتددو  فدد "يفيي 
و.  ددي ايدداح اح دخ ددو ذتدداي  فدد  ف يي احددفيي دف ايددو ح  ايددو خجددخفذر خ د هددر  نددا اح فيتدد

ددا  ي"د   ذدء ا "يدفيخحخجي هر خ ة فددفا هر احفيتيدو  ندا اح ج  دع اح  نددا خثاح داحا ةهد ا ي ند  تخ  
 دي فددخا اح"هدر ثدديي اي د يي. يددء ي الفدياف ثدداتهر ال د اذ احخ يددفخي احد يي حددفيهر اح د  ةددا 
 اح دددر خية ثدد خي احثدداقا ا ثدداا  اي دد  . ةددا احخاقددعف يفدداا الفددياف ةهددر  ددخق"هر اح فيفددا خذدد ا
يددددءف   حددددا تددددخه  ددددي فددددخا اح"هددددر حنةفيددددف  ددددي جخاتددددح اح يدددداو   دددد  احددددفيي خالفخا  ا ج  ا يددددو 
خ دفختا  احفددنخيف خت يجدو حدد حي يد ر   دددي   "هدخر   دد   اي د  . خذددد اف ي دي   "هددخر  اي دد   
 حددا " دد اذ  ددي ت"ددس احفياتددو خاحجتفدديو خحدددي ثفددثح خجددخف تددخه  ددي فددخا اح"هددر احددفيتاف ةفددف 

   "هدخر  اح ددار خاي د  . حدفس احفدافو  احد يد   دي احةيدخح اح دا  فدثح دد  "عث خا " فاا   
ذدد ا احتددخه  ددي فددخا اح"هددر ثدديي احتدداس  ددي ت"ددس احةدد   خةددا ذدد ا احث ددل فددي ر   نيدد  افدد  فار 
اح  ددخ   خاحن ددو  خاحفددنخي حددف ر اح خضددخه اح ليفددا اح ددا  ددفخ   خحددلا اح خايددو خذددخ "تددلا   ي دددي 

 جاذ  احتاس ثةضهر احثة . د ا فدي ر  فدنيأ احضدخا  ندا دي"يدو   قا و الإتفاتيو ثفهخحو   ا
اف  فار احفيي ةا عةفو فخدي   يع   احتاس  ي خاقدع اح يداو ثفدثح ذد ا اح "هدخر اح داأ   
خيتفف خي  حا  ج خ ا    قيو ع ي و  ف   ثةضدها احدثة . ت يجدو حد حيف ةفدف احتداس ذدخي هر 

 ع ي و  ال"يي  ي  ا ي   اي   .خ"عث خا  جهخحيي خ  حخا "ت"فهر ةا  تأفو 
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"Sa’ada's BraidsThe Concept of Others in Ghafoory's " 

Certificate 

This is to certify that the work entitled: The Concept of Others in 
Ghafoory's "Sa’ada's Braids", is original and has been carried out 
by Bal-eid Taha Shamsan Saeed. This paper has not been 
published in any journal and is not considered for publication 
either. 

Abstract  
    Title: The Concept of others in Alghafory's Sa’ada's Braids  
This research aims at studying the concept of others in Alghafory's 
Sa’ada's Braids, a novel written in 2014. The novel investigates the 
situation of people in Sa’ada, a city in the northern part of Yemen. A 
group of people call themselves the masters are ruling the city availing 
from the absence of the government there and they start using religion 
as a propaganda to protect their presence and rule over the city.   
    The masters impose their ideology and religious beliefs on the local 
community. Consequently, this creates a kind of misunderstanding 
among other people. The masters believe that they are the only people 
who have the rights to rule and consider the rest as outsiders “the 
others”. In fact, the masters misunderstand their real attitude and this 
leads to a kind of misconception of many facets of life such as religion, 
social roles and codes of conduct, and as a result a concept such as “the 
others” is formed. Thus, the concept of others refers to people of the 
same religion and nationality but because there is a kind of religious 
misconception, they have become enemies: the rulers and the others. 
The others’ attitude towards religion does not happen to be in the same 
circle of the masters’ faith. 
     The masters have many flaws that cause all this kind of 
misunderstanding among people of the same race. The use of symbols, 
setting, language, allusions and behavior will be analysed to support the 
novelist’s main theme that humanity cannot be established easily if 
people ignore each other. How religion is utilized in Sa’ada is also 
highlighted and as a result, people are distracted from the reality of life 
and they have formed the concept of others. 
   Finally, because of this misconception and the forming of the others, 
people are deluded from the reality and divided into small ethnic 
groups killing each other. As a result, their identity is lost and they have 
become unknown. They have secluded themselves in a small area being 
afraid of the influence of the "others" who are considered untouchable 
and should be rejected and fought.  
Key Words: Alghafory,-the other- misconception- Sa’ada’s Braids - 
masterhood – enmity- inequality-  
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Literature Review 

Marwan Ghafoory dedicates his novel Sa’ada’s Braids to humanity, 
peace and equality among people. He tries to show clearly the disease 
of the masters’ role in Sada’a. A woman is the central character of the 
novel which also shows how women are abducted from the scenario of 
life as if she is a kind of disease that may harm the body.  

In this regard, Abdulsalam Alrubaidi writes about Marwan Ghafoory’s 
Sa’ada’s Braids in an article titled Humanism in the Yemeni Novel 
and its Use in the School Curricula, (14/8/2017) where the novel is 
one of the important evidences used for the writer: “In Marwan Al-
ghafoory’s Sa’ada’s Braids (2014) women takes a central role in the 
narrative, telling the story of crushed womanhood in Yemen. This 
specific portrayal of women in the novel is structurally related to the 
state of political and tribal traditions.” 

Ghafoory’s Sa’ada’s Braids depicts the true definition of humanity 
and shows how individual is important. Consequently, Abdulsalam 
adds: “By humanity I mean placing importance on individual, removed 
from any identities added to her or him through socialization and 
circumstances that have shaped her or his life. In other words, to be 
humanist is to respect basic human identity regardless of any ethnic or 
religious affiliations or geographic belongings. It implies also 
respecting an individual’s attitudes and convictions.” 

Ghafoory focuses on many ideas regarding the place and the people 
who live there and how politics and religion are well utilized for some 
personal matters. In this regard it is written in a review (28-12-2015)   
on www.8gharb.com:  “The novel is about Sa’ada and Iman who tells 
her story to the novelist, the main narrator. How Iman’s hair braids 
are fallen from the top of the mountains, the secret of her swollen belly, 
the war, and traditions are also highlighted in the novel. The 
mercenaries and those who utilize religion to fulfill their political and 
personal desires have important roles in the novel and they become the 
reasons behind war and obstinacy which also help in crushing 
womanhood.” 

Although the novel focuses on many ideas, its main object is to show 
people are lost when they are divided by some blind beliefs. War and 
disunity take place instead of love is another important theme that the 
novel focuses on.  

The locked society is vividly described by the strange beliefs and 
traditions which causes woman to suffer a lot as a result of being 
abandoned. Mr.Faiz Alam writes in another review (25/5/2015): 
“Through her letters, Iman depicts how her society is blocked and as a 
result, woman is subjected to injustice. She is not allowed to study 
because of the unbelievable vacuumed ideas practiced by the people 
there.” 

In another review by Aljazeera (15/11/2014), it is written that Sa’ada’s 
Braids focuses on love and war as an important idea for Ghafoory: 
“The novel depicts the struggle between love and war. The war is 

http://www.8gharb.com/
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presented as a kind of worm that stole the happiness from the whole 
country, started in Sa’ada and spread to the whole parts of the nation.” 

Moreover, the technique of narration is brilliant in the story as the 
novelist focuses on one central character using the third person point of 
view. In this regard, Aljazeera described (15/11/2014) Sa’ada’s Braids 
“as one of the  most important novels which reflects the miseries of the 
whole nation through the life of a single character, Iman. The novelist 
goes deep into the catastrophe faced by the Yemeni citizen and how he 
looks forward to get rid of these obstacles that handicap a glamorous 
future.” 

In the same review of Aljazeera, it is mentioned that, “the dilemma of 
the whole narration is embodied in the problem of the Yemeni woman 
who is surrounded by the unfair traditions and wrong belief which 
deprived her from her rights of living.” 

The novelist uses a shrewd tool of narration as the novelist himself 
becomes the main narrator who is speaking with the heroine using his 
real name, Marwan. Regarding this, in a review, (22-01-2015) in 
raseef22.com, Mr.Faiz Alam writes:  

“Marwan Ghafoory exchanges letters with the heroine of his novel 
Iman who tells her story and the narrator answers all Iman’s questions. 
He also encourages her to continue writing and at the same time, he 
reminds her of her previous details. He never hides how her letters 
influences him and what feelings they have created inside him.” 

It is obvious that the technique of narration helps the narrator to show 
how woman is presented as a victim that cannot even speak about her 
rights of life and if she does, she is considered a traitor that should be 
punished. 

Furthermore,  the novelist condemns illiteracy which is expanded as a 
result of the increase of the misconception of wrong beliefs that are 
practiced in Sa’ada. Many people become the victims of illiteracy as 
they are led to the battlefield like goats. Even woman becomes one of 
these victims who is always the pole of suspicion and therefore she is 
deprived from her freedom. Fatima Wasel writes in a review on 
Soundcould (27/11/2014): “Iman is the daughter of a Yemeni city 
called Sa’ada. She recounts her story and how people with their 
suspicion and strange traditions condemns her unfairly. Iman becomes 
the symbol of every Yemeni woman who sews their beauty out of the 
sun”  

Finally, Iman echoes all the Yemeni women who need freedom to live 
without being prisoned by some false misconceptions. Sa’ada’s Braids 
is of 239 pages and it is the best voice about the condemnation of war 
that kills brothers of the same race, nationality and religion. It attacks 
those who exploit religion for their personal interests. The novel also 
rejects illiteracy and considers it as a disease that blinds the generation 
and it also denounces the crushed womanhood by ignoring their least 
needs and rights. 
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The Concept of others in Ghafoory's "Sa’ada's Braids" 

Introduction  

"Sa’ada’s Braids" is a novel written by Marwan Ghafoory whose 
popularity flourishes as a novelist and a political writer in the twentieth 
century. The quality of his writing improved and added to the world of 
literature in Yemen. This novelist has rebelled against the superficial 
and traditional style of other Yemeni writers. He is considered as a 
modern Yemeni novelist as his novels embraced more interesting and 
complex themes. 

 These themes are related to religion, politics and gender equality. He 
tries to reflect in his novels the religious and political instability in the 
country. The religious and political conflicts provide Marwan the best 
environment for his fiction. Most of his books depict the life of Yemeni 
people which is full of difficulties and sorrows caused mostly by the 
misuse of religion and politics. 

Marwan is considered as a humanist writer who has shown respect to 
the individual. He shows respect to the basic human identity of his 
characters regardless any religion norms, or region. Furthermore, his 
books imply respect for the individual’s convictions and attitudes. The 
novels depict these humanist manifestations through the characters’ 
behaviour. These characters show their emotional values through 
human and social feelings such as gratitude, respect and recognition. 

The issues of political and religious crisis are the essential components 
of Marwan’s novels. He shows these issues as a result of what happens 
in the country. In other words, he blames the political and religious 
regimes for what has been brought to the country such as war and the 
threat of death to many citizens. 

Marwan’s characters have embraced humanist philosophical thoughts 
which reflect how people suffer under some religious and political 
trauma. Thus, they depict a terrible Yemeni scenario which lacks peace 
and equality among people in an expanded philosophical way. 

Marwan’s novels study the recognition of the others by giving them the 
right to exist like other Yemeni citizens. His novels show that “the 
others” have complete historical, political, and cultural belongings but 
under the misuse of religion and politics, they become minor humans 
and they do not have the right of equality. In other words, these 
equalities are not recongnised at all because of some political and 
religious attitudes of the masters.  

Marwan’s Sa’ada’s Braids is a shout in the face of an oppressive 
religious norms practiced in Sa’ada. It condemns the political and 
religious performance of a group of people called the Masters who 
believe that they are God’s chosen and therefore, they have the rights to 
rule and impose whatever they want on the others. The masters believe 
that the others are chosen to be servants for them. Under their rule, 
there is an absence of a distinctive demand for liberty and freedom 
which are the basic fundamentals of humanity. In other words, social 
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harmony based on logic, justice and mutual recognition are always 
dissolved and replaced by the misconceptions of reality and life. 

The story of the novel takes place in Sa’ada which is a governorate in the 
north part of Yemen and it shows how people there use religion as a cover 
for their political propaganda. It introduces the story of a Yemeni girl, the 
heroine of this novel. She tells her story through corresponding letters to 
Marwan who is himself the author of this novel. 
"I am a girl from Sa’ada, my pseudonym is Iman."   The author  puts 
the elements of seriousness in his story from the beginning as Iman 
tells him that she is afraid that her story may die out:    "I have the 
desire of dying, and I am afraid that my story will die with me." P: 25 
Iman lives with her family: her father, mother, her sister Abeer and her 
brother, Hassan. She tells her personal story with her hair braids, her 
swollen belly, and the war that attacks each house in Sa’ada by killing 
many people. 

“Sa’ada’s Braids ” focuses on the story of Iman with her masters and 
their strange behavior and beliefs. She has a family who belongs to the 
masters. However, Iman revolts against what the masters believe in, 
and she shows her revolt in her letters to Ghafoory who is the only 
correspondent with her. The character of Iman is employed to show 
how ridiculous the masters are when practicing and imposing what they 
believe in on the others. This is all shown to be ridiculous by the 
narrator throughout the story from the beginning to the end in a 
fabulous manner using some literary elements such as allusions 
symbols, the language, and the setting of the novel.  

An overview to the novel       The main story is about Iman’s belly 
which is formed by a strange disease that attacks her belly from inside. 
This story is used as evidence to reveal the blindness of the masters. 
The people believe that Iman has committed an a adultery and become 
got pregnant and look at her with suspicion. However, Iman does not 
get weak and wants to prove to the whole village including her family 
that she is not pregnant and what she carries in her belly is no more 
than a disease. Therefore, she decides to leave Sa’ada and go to Sana’a 
for therapy. In Sana’a the doctors find that Iman has got a tumor inside 
her belly which proves that she has been misjudged by her people. 
Moreover, this also reflects that what people in Sa’ada believe in does 
not help them to judge others correctly. The masters always behave as 
if they were superior to the others. This kind of superiority creates a 
kind of blindness and misconception of truth. 

Furthermore, the novel portrays the misconception of belief, and what 
it comes after. For instance, the title of the novel “Sa’ada’s Braids ” 
suggests the dark side of the muddle that surrounds people there. 
“Braids” suggests the inequalities among people which help to create 
the class distinctions based on the misconception of religion which 
causes that the whole community is flawed by this kind of misbelief. 

This kind of misconception increased among people of the same 
nationality which is nourished by misusing religion, and consequently, 
the masters and those who believe in them become narrow-minded. For 
instance, Iman’s mother believe entirely of what the masters say about 
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heaven, and even she hates the Jews not because of some personal 
matters but the masters say that they are bad. The following dialogue 
between Iman and her mother about Iman’s meeting with a Jewish lady 
called Shama’a shows this kind of attitude that people are forced to 
adopt what is imposed on them blindly:  “Your father does not want 
you to visit Shama’a anymore,” the mother said.“Why?” Iman asks. 
“The Jews do not like us, and we don’t trust them.”  

“But, why? they are Yemenies like us. They believe in the prophet 
Mohammed and they like our land exactly like us.”  “She is vicious. 
She says they believe in the prophet Mohammed?” The mother 
wonders.       “Yes.       “Did you ask her? Or did she say that by 
herself?” the mother impatiently asks. “I asked her.”  “Why did you 
ask her?”       “I don’t know.”    “What else did the Jewish woman 
say?”       “She said that Mohammed is a prophet…..but of tribes.”      
“Cursed. Didn’t you understand? The prophet of tribes!” The mother 
replies angrily.   “God bless us. What did you say to her?” the mother 
asks again. “She said they think that Mohammed is a prophet!” the 
mother adds.  “Why don’t you try to understand her?” Iman enquires.  
“Impolite. I don’t want to understand her. She says he is the prophet of 
the tribes.” The mother says.  “But he is a prophet.” 

“Be careful. Never be heard by your father or any.”     P:31:32 

Obviously, the masters believe that they are the true chosen to rule and 
they do not find clear reasons for their opinions of the others. They 
practice some kinds of discrimination in their judgment on the others. 
Like his mother, Hassan gets confused when he is asked by his sister, 
Iman, about the reason why he kills a soldier who comes from Taiz 
which is another city in the middle of the country. Hassan could not 
provide a satisfactory answer to his sister. 

The setting 

The novel begins when Iman starts corresponding whit Ghafoory 
telling him her story. The author chooses two main places for his story 
either Sa’ada or Sana’a and there are also some other places that 
reechoed the theme of misconception. In this regard, Iman says: 

 “I am a girl from Sa’ada . My name is Iman and this is not my real 
name. I have my story and I am really a story. Just let me know if you 
are ready to hear it. I don’t claim that my story will leave a moral 
lesson, nevertheless, it will be a source of pain…I don’t know my 
enemies to defeat them. My enemies don’t know me, either.  We are just 
divided into defeated and winners.”  P:5  

The story is narrated using the flashback as Iman begins her story when 
she is in Sana’a, the place that she moved to from Sa’ada:  

“Yesterday before dawn, it was very clear and there was no voice 
except the dog in our neighborhood. This section is signed by Iman 
while she is in Sana’a:  

Iman  
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Sana’a, 4
th

 February 2014 

In his first reply, Ghafoory writes: 

“You are from Sa’ada?   

Ok. Impressive. A victim wants to get a victory on a defeated rival:” 
P:7 

It is clear that Alghafroy did not expect that the correspondent would 
be from Sa’ada, and his reply shows how terrible this place is, by the 
way the character writes. Sa’ada is described as a place where people 
are killing each other and this is why he uses the term “defeated”. 

Furthermore, Alghafroy refers to “Belad Waq Alwaq”, a novel written 
by Alzobery, a Yemeni poet and novelist, as a witness to what is 
happening in Sa’ada. The situation is the same either in the story 
presented by Alzobery or Marwan Ghafoory: people are divided into 
classes; each class is a victim for the other. There is only one winner in 
this chaos which is the past. 

Iman is now in Sana’a, the capital of the country and she is referred as 
if she has just won the war by her leaving Sa’ada and coming to this 
place. Sana’a is considered the center of the Yemeni revolution of the 
year 2014. This proves Ghafoory’s support for the revolution. He 
writes about the 2014 revolution, as if it was not just a revolution: “it 
was a magic dramatic history.” P: 9  

The setting is reechoed either by repeating the names of the places or 
the time, and sometimes by repeating the story itself. Iman tells her 
story and Ghafoory repeats it again in order to provide a real circle of 
life to the whole story. In addition, all the places and dates connections 
are real which also adds clarity to the story and to the historical 
references.  

Furthermore, the capital Sana’a is renamed as “the Open Sea” which is 
a symbol of a cosmopolitical place of attitudes and beliefs comparing to 
Sa’ada. This “Open Sea” is connected with Iman as she is compared 
with Albringo, a historical literary figure, who got out safely from the 
mouth of the whale. Iman comes from Sa’ada with its dangerous 
connotations and so is referred by the whale to Sana’a, the Open Sea. 
She has breathed a new life in Sana’a as it is the city of revolution 
against all the misconceptions that are well-demonstrated in Sa’ada. 
She becomes the symbol of hope when she reaches Sana’a, the safest 
place for her story. Her story will not die as she is afraid of. She is now 
like Albringo who lived in a deserted place such as Sa’ada. Both Iman 
and Albringo could live either in Sa’ada or in the Atlantic because they 
have a strong faith of success. Comparing Iman’s story to Albringo,  
Algafory wonders: 

“How did Albringo live all that time in a horrible place in the 
Atlantic?” P:23 
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“You are a woman who got out of a jungle and came into a jungle.” P: 
23 

Moreover, the description of the village in Sa’ada where Iman lives and 
the way the houses are built reinforces the theme of misconception. It 
creates a big gab of misunderstanding among people. Iman describes 
her village saying: 

“Our village consists of a long lines of houses built in a mountain from 
down up…The mountain is the back wall for our houses. There is no 
backyard, and the horizon is  opposite us in which there stands a long 
various plains and small and quite medium hills. This horizon is closed 
by high mountains. These plains do not belong or indebted anything to 
anyone.” P: 27 

It is clear that everything is closed even the natural beauty such as 
plains or mountains. There is always an end for any horizon, which 
manifests itself symbolically to show how people are closed in their 
belief. They feel ashamed of their religion and they do not want the 
others to share them as they become afraid of being fluctuated between 
their belief and the others. They think that they have been chosen as 
God’s messengers to be the only race who are responsible for the 
aspect of religion and its spread, and they look at others suspiciously 
when they speak about religion. 

In fact, the author invades Sa’ada using the character of Iman as he 
deeply explores the villages details and he shows how misconception 
changes people and droves them to the darkest age. Consequently, the 
people in Sa’ada become blind to the fact that such misunderstanding 
creates a kind of precarious ambiguity among the people of the same 
race and religion. This is why Ghafoory chooses Sa’ada to be the main 
place for his novel.  

Such type of confusion and misconception is very clear in Sa’ada 
because people there are suffering from this kind of dilemma. In this 
regard, Iman says that her father does not hate the Jews but he says that 
they are blind because they do not follow the right path. She is certain 
that because the belief of Alwhabion in Sa’ada spreads speedily -
Alwhabion is a name refers to a religious group of people who 
followed the doctrine of Mohmmed Abdulwahab appeared in the 
Arabian Peninsula in the eighteenth century -, her father is driven mad 
because he thinks that this kind of danger that may shackle the belief of 
his group. 

Furthermore, the whole village of Iman is free from any public school. 
She says that one cannot see any schoolboy or school uniform in any 
place in Sa’ada. It is a disastrous situation which attacks every 
individual there as people neglect every aspect of civilization because 
of their strange ideas. This is all happens because of misunderstanding 
of the concept of religion which creates this kind of misconception.  

The whole place of the city is haunted with the idea of paradise and its 
citizens. For instance, Iman’s mother says:  
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“God has divided the sustenance and ancestries. He created the poor 
people to serve the chosen ones, and in return the chosen will use their 
holy mediation in the hereafter to help the poor.”              P:15 

Iman refuses this idea and tells her mother: 

“That was not fair and not even true.” The mother warned her 
daughter not to speak such ideas again because they are against their 
beliefs. Iman continues: 

“Mom, they are also speaking about the paradise young people.”  

Iman says: 

“My mother quickly puts her hands over my mouth and does not let me 
continue speaking, and she said: 

“Shh. Be careful, Iman.” P:15 

Clearly, the setting reflects the purpose of the novelist of showing the 
imprisonment of life that caused by the masters and their misuse of 
religion. In other words, life is not worthy living there as the people are 
surrounded by these false norms of politics and religion. They do not 
have control on their life but they find themselves led by some ugly 
false ideas. 

The character of Iman 

Iman is brought up to be educated and have a close view at the different 
beliefs run in her village. She studied the masters’ ideas and Alwhaby’s 
books. She is a social woman who does not mind listening and sharing 
others’ beliefs. She always visits the Jewish lady, Shama’s and walks 
with Saffia who is considered superior in race to other masters’ girls. 
She says: 

“We always visit Shama’a to listen to her stories. We never ask her 
about the Jews or Muslims before this meeting. She has also never been 
conservative or afraid of us. Shama’a has also been the best and 
kindest old woman for me.” P:30 

Iman is open-minded and likes to listen and compare the ideas even if 
they are strange to her belief. She says that one of Alwhabeens called 
Yahea gives some books and cassettes to her close friend Saffia. The 
latter does not want to listen to them as she is afraid that her beliefs 
would be disturbed. Iman takes some of these cassettes and books. She 
reads and listens, and accordingly she starts warning Saffia about her 
relationship with Yahea. Regarding what she has read, Iman warns 
Saffia: 

“It is better for a man to be nilled on his head rather than to have a 
relationship with a woman illegally”                           P:41 

It is obvious that Iman has inferred that Yahia’s belief will not allow 
him to continue with Saffia. She becomes very intelligent and practical. 
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She advices Saffia to stop her relationship with Yahea and tells her that 
he will betray her because he does not believe in what he writes. She 
says that Yahea’s books say that “love has no meaning only in 
marriage.”  

Saffia says: “He tells me he will marry me.” 

“Nonsense. Only if he stops to go away.” Iman replies.   P:41 

Iman has a wide knowledge on the beliefs of others. She likes reading 
books. Her father as well as her grandfather have a big library in which 
she used to visit and read. Her mind is always nourished from these 
books. She is also open-minded as she never minds sharing others’ 
ideas. 

Ghafoory writes to her:   

 “keep in revealing the secrets of the village very simply. Your readers 
will not believe that you are a girl who brought up in Sa’ada. Like me 
they will think that your story is the golden door of the whole country.” 
P: 65 

Iman is also described as a modern Yemeni character who has her own 
Facebook account. She is interested not only in the net as a modern 
social media but she is a movie fan,too. She writes to Ghafoory: 

“I think this idea has pushed you to be silent when I told you that I 
would stop my Facebook account and disappeared. I left you a smile 
gesture but you sent me a movie link. I copied the link in a file in my 
computer.” P: 65 

Later on, she writes: 

“I watched the movie of Wuthering Heights with my friend Zainab in 
Sana’a, the one I have told you about before.”   P: 65 

Iman now indulges in the movie and starts reflecting and comparing her 
correspondence with Ghafoory like the story of Heathcliff and 
Catherine in Bronte’s Wuthering Heights.  

Ghafoory satirizes the values of the masters through the character of 
Iman. She is constructed as a self-realizing heroine in her village either 
in her family or with her female friends. She is presented as an 
independent girl who is lively, wit, charming and intelligent. Moreover, 
she has a revolutionary belief about her people and the city, particularly 
the masters’ approach to the relationship between religion and life 
which humiliates the position of others who do not belong to the 
masters’ rank. 

The novel was written in 2012 after the breakout of the 2011 revolution 
in which Ghafoory himself was a part through his writings. Thus, it is 
not strange that Ghafoory manipulates the character of Iman by 
providing her with some of his revolutionary thoughts. Iman has keen 
knowledge about the masters of her city and the others’ attitudes 



  مجلة العلوم التربوية والدارسات الإنسانية                                             

 

 

324 
 

The Concept of Others in Ghafoory's "Sa’ada's…  Dr. Baleid Taha Shamsan 

 م2020( يونيو 10(،  العدد )5المجلد)

towards what happens. Therefore, she serves Ghafoory’s aim in 
searching for equality between people. 

Regarding her role in the novel, Iman interacts and shares her ideas and 
beliefs frankly with her girl friends such as Saffia and the Jewish lady, 
Shama’a, as well as with each member of her family. In addition, she is 
a good reader and a student, too. Her role is utilized perfectly as a 
witness of what happens. However, Ghafoory does not portray the 
masterhood as a kind of vengeance of enmity; rather he shows that the 
masters are practicing wrong beliefs and concepts which cause a kind 
of racism. The others are portrayed as a second race in the master 
dominated society. Therefore, in order to understand what happens in 
such society, a detailed story is constructed to accompany Iman in her 
journey of revolution. 

In addition, Ghafoory has consctructed the character of Iman in a such 
a way to be independent, and to be able to reflect how and why equality 
should be there in her society. Iman interacts with the other characters 
such as Saffia or Shama’a in order to reveal their thoughts and show 
how different they are. For instance, Saffia suffers from an excessive 
masterly pride while the Jewish lady, Shama’a who is mostly 
considered as an abhorring character to the master because she is a Jew, 
is attached with a kind of humanity and simplicity. 

Ghafoory’s Iman acts as a symbol of revolutionary voice against the 
whole misconceptional rules and beliefs of the masters. Iman’s 
intelligence and liberal mind shows the clues about the exposition of 
social indifferences caused by the misuse of religion. She is also free 
and brave to convey her views and opinions. For example, she 
expresses her opinion about the people she saw in Sana’a during the 
revolution: 

“They sold me some biscuits in the morning and bread in the afternoon. 
They smiled at me, and they were very polite with me, too.”P:15 

And about herself, she says: 

“I was beautiful like the moon, as my sister Abeer used to say. But they 
quickly got rid of me, as if they were waiting for such chance. I lost the 
ability to talk and comprehend about the things around me.” P:93 

It is clear that Iman is a revolutionary character and she can express her 
thoughts regardless the social and religious obstacles the masters have 
enrolled upon people. 

It is unconventional for a girl from Sa’ada to begin a conversation or 
correspondence. However, Iman rejects the silence and the place the 
masters have planned for people in Sa’ada. She becomes courageous 
enough to express her own thoughts unlike her other people. For 
example, when she is in the car, with her brother and the sheikh’s son 
on their way to Sana’a, she expresses her opinion openly how war is 
bad: 
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“War has brought us misery whether its champions were mujahedeen 
or criminals.”P:128 

On top of that, Iman has a high degree of self-confidence. She always 
faces her mother and her brother regarding the tumor in her belly. She 
tells Ghafoory that she realizes how people look at her with suspicion 
but she never gives up life. She persuades her family to take her to 
Sana’a for the purpose of therapy. 

From the beginning of the novel, Iman never gives up her pursuit for 
showing the reality of what happens in her village to the whole world 
let it dies: 

“I am afraid that my story will die with me” P:25    

She believes that the class distinction is too big in her village due to the 
masters’ established and enlarged ways of dealing with the others. This 
kind of separation among people causes a kind of engulf and enmity. 
Iman gives many details to support her belief of the false norms 
practiced by the masters. 

The Masters 

As far as history is concerned, the “masters” is a group of people 
appeared in the farthest part of the north of Yemen. They took the 
advantage of the absence of the government there and established 
themselves under the name of “Masters”. They claim that they are the 
descendent of the prophet Mohammed. Sa’ada is a rural and isolated 
place in the northern part of the country and the absence of the 
government there encouraged these people to control the area and 
impose their beliefs on the other dwellers. 

The flaws of masters 

The masters believe themselves to be above the others. They assume 
that they know better than the others. They also believe that they are 
better and the others are ignorant and less intelligent. They always 
think that they are extraordinary and flawless people because they have 
been chosen to be the purest race. They possess a kind of pride and 
vanity whereas the others are thought to be an inferior race. 

Copnsequently, the community falls a victim for such miserable 
thoughts. The masters affect the thoughts of the individuals who live 
there. Everyone in this community becomes a prey for the strange 
thoughts and beliefs of the masters. These thoughts and beliefs attack 
each individual and as a result, they suffer the absence of the logic.  

Ghafoory writes about the society which is concerned with 
misconceptions, appearances, and strange beliefs. These beliefs fuel 
nearly all the social and religious gatherings. The theme of judgment is 
very important to reestablish these beliefs. It becomes customary for 
people to judge each other according to their titles in the society. In 
other words, the “Masters” is a title which is entangled with the idea of 
righteousness. If you belong to the masters, then you have the right to 
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judge or live above the “Others”. If you don’t belong to the masters, 
you must live as a guest in your land, and you don’t have the right to 
ask about these beliefs: you just listen and obey. Consequently, a big 
gab is established between the two social sides: the masters and the 
others. The others, whether in Sa’ada or outside, find a kind of 
disrespectability and therefore, a lifetime of insecurity and unhappiness 
is created. 

Ghafoory shows the flaws of the masters by presenting their behavior 
and relationship with the others. The novel includes a number of 
interesting components such as an intriguing plot, standard language 
which is full of images, allusions, symbols and some brilliant 
characters. The novelist presents his novel through a dialogue between 
Ghafoory, who is considered as the main narrator and the heroine of the 
novel, Iman. Ghafoory has involved himself as a narrator and actor at 
the same time.  

The characters and their flaws are described in a serious interesting 
manner by Iman. The reader is indirectly involved into this kind of 
seriousness as he is presented to the peculiar behavior of the characters. 
The novelist shows his brilliant authorship as he lets the reader reflects 
how ridiculous and absurd the masters are. 

Religion is utilized   

Religion is important for the individual and the society. It is the best 
foundation to spread morals and good behaviour among people as it 
organizes their behavior and dealing with others. It also helps them to 
build good relationship with each other and let them take the right 
decision regarding the good beliefs, faith and traditions.  The individual 
uses religion to acquire the best virtue as a bridge of connection with 
God.  

People believe that religion contributes to establish peace, stability and 
tranquility in the societies because the individuals' behavior is well-
balanced under the right practice of religion. In religion, there is a kind 
of discipline among people that helps to spread respect and duty. It 
eradicates the differences between people and all together help each to 
get rid of their shortage. Therefore, they try to seek unity under the 
name of religion whatever the differences are. Under the concept of 
religion, the individual becomes responsible of his role in society, 
regarding building, education and other concepts which helps to 
enhance the process of social development. 

As a result, religion organizes these sets of morals, beliefs and 
understanding, and the individual then uses them to achieve his role in 
society. Religion is needed by the individual and this explains why 
people spontaneously ask God to help them when they are in trouble. 
Moreover, religion contributes to establish the equality among people 
by eradicating their differences.  

However, religion can be misused for some political and worldly 
purposes which creates problems. For instance, practicing politics 
through religion causes weakness among people’s contributions to 
establish differences and emphasizes social class divisions which lead 
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to create different kinds of conflicts among people. And as a result, the 
policy of living together fails which is the basic foundation of the 
modern society. Living together is a necessary tactic to spread peace 
among people but because religion is used wrongly, failure is the final 
procedure.  

Ghafoory’s “Sa’ada’s Braids” aims to explore the consequences if 
religion is utilized for some political purposes. Religion becomes a 
bloody and successful weapon on the hands of politicians. It is used to 
make the nation succumb blindly to some shadow elements. This is 
what happened in Sa’ada as it is shown in the novel. The author shows 
how people are committed to some aspects of religion blindly. They 
think that their life has no meaning only if they surrender to religion. 
Politicians are very successful as they make people believe that they 
have no identity without believing in the norms of ventures that are 
created under the flags of the politicians. 

The novelist here wants to show that people should eradicate these 
foolish paths of thinking and begin to form new views of their own. He 
strongly believes that people must not blindly pursue religion without 
thinking of what is right or good for themselves. They should not be 
obsessed with religion simply and obey their masters thoughtlessly. 
According to Ghafoory, religion is utilized politically for some worldly 
purposes in such a way which leads to hypocrisy and then division 
among people takes place which causes differences and then war breaks 
up. This negative attitude by people is clearly revealed in the novel 
through the use of characters, their names, the way they think, their 
behavior and especially through the symbols and the plot itself.  

It is clear that Ghafoory is very familiar with the type of religion 
practiced in Sa’ada and the social problems that arose mostly form the 
wrong misconception and the absence of people's awareness towards 
the political utilization of religion. Thinking of religious misuse of 
those people in that area is a clear examination made by the novelist to 
question the existing religious forces that have made people blind 
towards each other. He has used some bitter and tragic stories in the 
novel to help the reader perceiving the reflection of his strong negation 
of that belief practiced in Sa’ada. 

The stories chosen are plainly provided and explained to attract the 
sentimentality of the readers. Therefore, he could show the ugly faces 
of the politicians who have misused religion for some political 
purposes. He describes many situations of different characters. From 
the different social masses used in the novel such as "the masters" "the 
Jews" and "the common", the novel arouses the sympathy of the 
readers, and accordingly Ghafoory paves the way for a suitable 
alternative to dissolve these differences. 

These stories are disappointing and through their presentation the 
novelist tries to seek a kind of revolution against the harsh thoughts of 
those people who have established the idea of "others" using religion. 
And this is why he states his ideas clearly through the character of Iman 
who revolts against these beliefs as she shows this in her letters. 
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Through his heroine Iman, the novelist condemn the social behavior 
engulfed by the misuse of religion. He emphasizes that the existing 
beliefs are not fair and they are the direct responsible behind creating 
the norms of "others" that leads to the destruction of the whole society. 
He unveils the hidden social crests that are terribly affected by the 
wrong religious beliefs implemented there. The whole society is 
mocked which is controlled by some absurd ideas. He also criticizes 
these people who believe in these ideas and instead they should have 
important roles in each others' lives that may help to make their society 
better. 

Most of the incidents and the way the dialogue takes place show the 
novelist's harsh sentences and contempt against the people and their 
wrong beliefs. He shows how ridiculous to practice that strange 
outdated belief among people and utilized their lives to satisfy their 
wants. In this concern, Ghafoory writes:  

“to those whose health are deteriorating and then they died in the 
mountains like goats despite their masters’ bliss. The masters are not to 
be blocked at but those people who usually die and others never 
understand. The others frequently keep coming to the masters and they 
never question the absurdities of these ideas: P:52 

Regarding the masters’s bad deeds against Iman, he says: 

“Whatever their justifications, they are guilty, and this is what we know 
about them. The woman of your village want doubtlessly to prove your 
guilt not because it is attributed to God, but defending themselves. They 
have polluted your chastity and the war has smirched their blood” 
P:81 

 His dialogue with Iman, suggests the type of religion practiced in 
Sa’ada which has become useless because it helps to corrupt the 
citizens' minds which also leads to their divisions. 

Ghafoory’s Iman describes how poor thinkers her people are, even 
those who are supposed to be good intelligent readers like her father, 
follow the masters blindly without questioning them. The novelist tries 
to say that even the rulers themselves do not try to use logic in their 
dealing with others. They do not guide people to save them and even 
they are not able to answer people's questions. They drive people into 
another dilemma instead of guiding them to the reality. This is clearly 
shown when Iman asks her mother who is supposed to be from "the 
masters" about religion. Iman's mother shows an absolute blindness of 
her faith: 

“That was not fair and not even true.” The mother warned her 
daughter not to mention such ideas again because they are against 
their beliefs.  

“Mom, they are also speaking about the paradise young people.” .  

Iman says:  
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“My mother quickly puts her hands over my mouth and does not let me 
continue speaking, and she said: 

“Shh. Be careful, Iman.” P:15 
It is noticeable that their faith has become a kind of worldly slogans. It 
has nothing to do with religion or people's life or goods. These slogans 
are just dictated to people and they have to follow and interpret 
themselves. Moreover, they help to create blind people who can't 
negotiate their reality.  

Iman realizes the presence of "others" around her as she feels lonely 
and this justifies her needs for Ghafoory. Because of such realization, 
she becomes an alien to her people and her place. Ironically enough, 
she is loaded with a tumor as if she has become strange among others. 
This kind of reaction against those people justifies their absurdities due 
to their insensible and unreasonable slogans. In all the ways, Ghafoory 
tries to condemn the slogans practiced there as well as the followers of 
these slogans. 

In a way, the novelist wishes that humanshould be with God through 
pure logical beliefs. People should know what they follow by using 
their minds. He wishes that the belief practiced should promote people 
to be real humans who follow their minds but not slogans made by 
people for special purposes. So that people turn to make a change and 
build the way for their better lives and happiness. 

Moreover, the novelist highlights on the conversation between the 
characters to show how religious slogans limit people's knowledge 
about the world around them and this is clearly manifested by their 
consideration of their capital city, which is shown as a different world. 
Because of such limitation, their life has no target; only live to be 
killed. The religious slogans cause people' misery instead of happiness. 
The novelist has successfully shown how these religious matters are 
dangerous, and he always tries to pave the way for better change by 
awakening the people's minds.  

The novelist wants to suggest that there is a strong reaction and 
tendency in such characters such as Iman to reflect that these 
regulations are not helpful at all. On the contrary, they just act as 
opposite by creating a strong enmity inside people' minds which leads 
them to build the image of "others". They fight each other without 
obvious reasons: only they have different beliefs. For instance, Iman's 
brother Hassan is involved in the war against the "others" without 
knowing why he is fighting. To answer his sister's question about the 
reason of his fighting, he is stammered as he is not able to find a clear 
answer. Humans are turned to beasts because of the blind obedience to 
such slogans and this is what the novelist tries to suggest.  

As he opposes to such kind of misbelief, Ghafoory suggests that people 
become blind because they do not only obey their masters but also they 
become ignorant to anything beyond religion such as science or any 
kind of creativity. They lose their balance even in accepting any other 
forms of social or scientific norms. They even think that adhering to the 
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idea of science is against their beliefs. They advocate their close minds 
to accept nothing but only what their masters say. 

 This becomes clear when Iman's father gets sick and people believe 
completely that their master who has a knowledge of the holly 
medicine can cure him. Iman's father is suffering from a disease which 
attacks his lever but they depend completely on the master who is 
Safia’s father instead of taking him to the hospital. Iman says: 

“I did not believe at all in what the masters doing regarding healing 
people. I was sure enough that Safia’a father had nothing to do with 
sick people. It was just nonsense. However, when my father was about 
to die, I prayed that Safia’s father could do something to save my father 
from death. 

 I was shouting, “please, read, read. Use your secret. This time it will 
help.” 

 But he answers. “It is an evil. He got an evil cold. Just draw water on 
his body.” P: 73 

In addition, the novelist doubts the sincerity of the blind obedience of 
people and he tries to get some answers through the reaction of Iman to 
the religious attitudes of her people. He thinks that people are using 
these kind of conventions to mask their lack of faith, and this is why 
they pretend to be religious.  

Consequently, Ghafoory tries to put ahead the alternative change which 
is humanity and dialogue. For him, what people need is not strict 
religious regulations or slogans but the most original feeling in human 
nature and dialogue. He suggests that understanding each other does 
not lie in religious slogans, but in how people use their minds. What 
rescues Iman is the dialogue with the novelist as well as the doctor in 
Sana'a who reflects that human beings are those who stand for the 
mutual feeling.  

Ghafoory’s search for humanity 

The determination of dialogue and humanity is love, which is a human 
demand for everyone. To live in peace and understand each other is 
what the author claims. In other words, the religion of humanity is what 
needed rather than a definite religious belief that leads people to follow 
humans blindly and ignore their minds. Ghafoory wants to say that 
love, humanity, dialogue, feeling the presence of others, the rights of 
others to live and mutual understanding among people could make 
them safe and content instead of feeling hopeless, unsaved, and 
wrongful. 

The author pays attention to human dignity, understanding dialogue 
and feelings. He indirectly lets his readers believe that these norms or 
the religious slogans practiced in Sa’ada will be turned over. He hopes 
that people should be courageous enough to desert these despairing 
beliefs and replace them with love. He aims to spread a new type of life 
decorated with "good will". Ghafoory shows his readers that by mutual 
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understanding and dialogue with each other they could live 
harmoniously in Yemen.  

Ghafoory's ideologies of dialogue and spirit are reflected in his work, 
which look unfamiliar to those people who live in Sa’ada, and are stuck 
in the deformed religious traits. People's natural belief has been 
consumed in the new belief brought to them from the outside world. 
They fall victims to these religious slogans that are nurtured by politics. 
As a result, they live a narrow and shallow space constructed by fear, 
misunderstanding and hopelessness with nothing in their minds but 
hatred, and aimlessness. They have forgotten the real meaning of life 
and they lose the significance of their humanity. 

In fact, the novel is a sharp weapon against both this kind of society 
under such beliefs and these people who practice such kind of 
hypocrisy. It shows how societies are destroyed and shattered when 
people follow some particular slogans blindly. As a result, corruption, 
cruelty and immorality replace humanity, love and hope which are the 
true aspects of life that can be the best alternatives for malice and 
desperation. 

Moreover, humanity is replaced by religious slogans that led people to 
divide themselves into different social and religious classes. The 
concept of "others" is constructed and people then start working with it 
as it separates them from each other. It limits people's opportunities to 
learn about the "others".  The "others" now are considered inferior as 
they are defined as enemies. Consequently, tensions stimulated and war 
takes place instead of understanding. A kind of absurd generalization 
and wrongful judgments on the "others" becomes the only slogan 
practiced there.  

For instance, Iman's friend Saffia is from the masters. She can't get 
married to Yahea, a teacher there as he belongs to Alwhabeen, another 
religious title, and this is clear in Iman's words: 

Saffia's father is a venerable man in our village. She knows that she 
can't get married to Alwhabe Yahea. Her family will not allow this, not 
because of his different dress or he prays differently ...but because her 
father believes that he is the prophet's grandson. Therefore, as one of 
the masters, Saffia has to marry a man who belongs to the same class. 
She will wait for a groom who has the quality of the masters. Their 
blood should be the same."       P: 45 

Similarly, what happened to Abdulhafheth, the teacher there shows 
how misunderstanding leads people to be divided. Iman says: 

“Abdulhafeth comes back form Saudia Arabia and he was expelled to 
the village of the Jews for a long time. Later, the Jews were expelled 
too and Abdulhafeth's car was seen fired and thrown down to the end of 
the valley." P:45 

The novelist continues digging at the way humanity is destroyed by the 
separation of people and by giving examples such as in the case of 
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Abdulhafetah or even in the situation of one of Iman’s friends in the 
village. In this regard, one of Saffia'a friends says to Iman: 

"You want to compare yourself to Zainb? Even not in your dreams. 
Despite your knowledge of many books, you are still nothing; a duster 
even if it is cleared twenty times. Tribesmen and the masters are not 

equal."               P: 93 

It is clear that Iamn herself does not find a suitable place for her among 
the others. Compared to Saffia whose father is superior in rank, Iman is 
less respectable. 

Symbols 

The novel Sa’ada’s Braids is painted with the colour of using symbols. 
Ghafoory employs some symbols to convey the main message of 
misconception such as the title, the tumor, the character of Iman and 
the little girl.   

1) The title 

The word “Braids” is used in the title symbolically. Braids are always 
long, curvy and entangled which are the features of ambiguity and non-
ending darkness. Sa’ada is absorbed into the dilemma of darkness and 
misconception truth. Moreover, the word “braids” indicates the 
difficulty of decoding the right bath. When we read the title “Sa’ada’s 
Braids”, we expect that the story is holding a romantic approach as the 
title suggests. However, the word “Braids” later becomes a symbol of 
disease, confusion and tyranny.  It is linked with Iman who suffers a lot 
from the tumor, people’s misjudgment and the masters’ behavior 
towards her from the beginning of the novel till the end.  

2) The symbolism of tumor 

Iman describes her internal pain as the "real war that nobody cares of, 
and nobody wants to know anything about."P:98   The pain stands as a 
strong creature inside the character which reflects the new faith of 
Iman. This faith is useless in such a remote place like Sa’ada. It will 
face a lot of contradictions since people do not want that faith. It is the 
new route to reality that people miss, and because it has been absent 
from people's minds for a long time, it becomes now strange. 

Iman suffers a lot carrying that pain inside her. She is presented as a 
prophet who carries his belief and has his companions such as her sister 
Abeer and her brother Hassan. This belief is described as a “tumor” 
which is in itself difficult to remove. It also shows how Iman’s belief in 
humanity is strong, nevertheless the rumor of people which 
accompanies her life during all her period of staying there. Similarly, 
the prophet mission is not easy to succeed. It needs a strong faith as it is 
always rejected by many people.  It is always rejected by many people. 
Iman’s thoughts are always strong to her people, too.  

3) The symbolism of Iman 
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Iman is an important symbol in the novel  as the author addresses her 
using words such as "the city of God, My sun, the flower that has 
lightened the mountain, plain……..The country wind that has brought 
peace but withered by war…….. "   Iman becomes "a symbol of God, or 
faith that the author summons to stop the flag of war. The name “Iman” 
has a very deep consideration in Arabic language which means faith. 
She is the faith of hope and peace as the writer describes her as a 
goddess. He calls her many times in the novel to save the world since 
she is capable enough of holding peace and establishing humanity 
among people. 

The author continues his summing for Iman as he says: 

"I have waited so long for you." "I have called you the sun of God, but 
it has been withered. Then you have come back again with another 
name called Iman…" P: 98 

Ghafoory believes in Iman and considers her as a goddess: 

“If you say you could cure people, or if you were a shaman in a forest, 
I would come to you and pray to heal me and pure my soul eternally. 
You are the saint with your long braids.” P:51 

Iman is treated as all religions or faiths and this is why the author has 
used symbolical names such as Zainab or Iman or the Sun of God. This 
is a call for the different types of all faiths to be united. It is the unity of 
all gods. Each name has its own quality. For example, the name Zainab 
has been recollected with rains, or the birds of the jungles. In other 
words, the author wants to emphasize that each kind of faith has its 
positives but people distort it by misusing it. The true faith is strongly 
needed to stop war which is cursed many times throughout this novel: 

" If war continues in such a manner, all our young men will be killed 
and there will be no men to marry our daughters." P:104 

On her way out of Sa’ada, Iman says: "I have not turned back to look at 
my village." She is treated as the prophet who was asked “never to look 
back.". The village is the source of evil and it should be cleared out 
from outside, and this is why Iman leaves Sa’ada to Sana'a.  

After that, Iman calls herself "a bride" referring to her new life which is 
of course better than the past. She is accompanied by songs which is 
also a symbol to the traditions of bride in the country. During her way 
out of the village, other women look at her as if they have envied her. 
Ironically enough, without the tumor Iman can't get enough: the tumor 
becomes the symbol of deliverance and freedom.  

During her trip, Iman comes across the village of the Jews and 
describes it as "deserted" because of the villagers' mistreatment of the 
Jews who are obliged to leave it. Clearly, the villagers' wrong beliefs 
are distorted by sowing its negative impact upon the surroundings. She 
wishes that if the prophet Mohammed or as she calls him "the prophet 
of the tribes" has been there, he will not blame her for the tumor as the 
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villagers do. Iman wants to say that what her people believe in cannot 
be the same belief of their prophet. 

Moreover, Iman's brother Hassan is presented as the true companion for 
the messenger of peace and hope; the qualities that are manifested 
through the character of Iman. Hassan believes in Iman and he has 
never trusted the truth of her faith. Iman says that they are more than 
being brothers. He always confronts her suffering. 

"I have believed in you." Hassan says to Iman P: 108  

"Don’t get depressed, I am your history" P: 115 

Hassan believes in Iman and he is sure that one day they will go back to 
their village to erase doubts and correct their faith.  

The author himself becomes one of Iman's companions and he is 
sometimes manifested as her brother Hassan, the first one who believes 
in her faith. The author is a representative of every citizen who suffers 
the chaos of war, and needs the help of Iman whatever her caste is, a 
faith that respects all others' beliefs, a faith that does not contempt 
others. Therefore, he quotes many to support her journey for the 
purpose of establishing peace. He falls in love with what Iman believes 
in, and he wishes she continues and never fails him down. She becomes 
the only hope for bringing peace into a place that has been distorted by 
enmity and war into a place that has no a strong faith but only a place 
where killing and abhorrence become the only inhabitants. 

4) The symbolism of the little girl 

On her way to Sana'a, Iman finds a young girl carrying the same name, 
Iman. She is another important symbol who reflects the new generation 
that will curse the old one. This girl belongs to a village whose 
inhabitants including her family members have all gone to the war, and 
the village becomes deserted.  It is very melancholic and it shows how 
the situation is regrettable because of the war. The girl says: 

“Those who got to war never come back" P: 118  

The girl holds a goat strongly as she is afraid of losing her only 
companion because everybody has gone to the war and never gone 
back again. However, this girl has also given Iman another twinkle of 
hope and a sense of optimism. 

The use of allusions  

Jules Verne who is considered the father of science fiction wrote many 
novels where the themes of innovation, unity and equality are his most 
concerns. He is used in Ghafoory’s novel for the purpose of innovation 
which is prohibited in the world of the masters due to their restricted 
beliefs and norms. Most of the characters of Vern’s novels are working 
as one team. They work with each other, complement each other and 
they depend on each other. In other words, Verne believes in the work 
of unity and equality among people so that people can succeed to 
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innovate. Ghafoory uses the ideas of Verne to prove that without 
equality and unity, it is impossible to achieve peace. There can be no 
sign of innovation or imporovements in the society if people don’t 
believe in equality among them.  

Allusions such as the story of Alkhazragy or Robinson Crusoe reflect 
the urgent need of a new faith. Iman’s journey to Sana’a is similar to 
that of Robinson’s where both characters are looking for innovations, 
freedom and improvements whether on the level of personal or social 
purposes. They have taken the innovative of change by taking the flag 
of journeys so that they can get rid of the strange beliefs that restrict 
their unity and equality. Robinson is a belief that may help in the 
equality of people. Before reaching that Island and achieving his 
dream, Robinson meets many obstacles and difficulties but he never 
gives up hopes. Similarly, Iman wants to overcome all the social 
obstacles made by the masters. She faces a lot of problems and 
difficulties and as a result, she has become an obstinate character 
enough to achieve her goal which is the equality and peace.  

The story of Al-ezy, is another important allusion that has a historical 
background regarding faith. During her journey to Sana'a, Iman has 
noticed the phrase: 

 "I have waited for a long time" which indicates that Al-Eezy has 
announced the coming of the new faith. P: 116   

The journey to Sana'a is a mission of reflection and hope. There are 
many sights of difficulties whether the road itself which is full of 
frightful cliffs or the many villages abandoned by the war. Iman meets 
some army men, who called "mujahedeen" a term used to call these 
who fight for the side of the masters.  According to Iman, these 
mujahedeen are responsible for the damage that destroyed her village.  

The writer suggests that by love people can reach peace and unity. And 
this is why he uses the story of Zal and Rodaba which is another 
example of allusion borrowed from the Iranian history.  Zal and 
Rodaba fall in love with each other and they get married in spite of all 
the difficulties and problems their families have made to stop their 
marriage. Their story is a tale of love and war in which love wins. 
Similarly, Marwan uses “Rodaba” as a title to call Iman in the sense 
that they both resemble each other. Marwan hopes that like Rodaba, 
Iman will also win the battle of life at the end.  

Furthermore, Iman has also exposed her history which reflects how 
different she is comparing to others in the village.  She has grown up as 
an educated lady who has read a lot of books in her life. She is 
influenced by her father and grandfather as they are good readers. She 
has read about the meaning of life from her teacher Abdulhafeth. She is 
now a companied by the car driver and Alsheikh's son and her brother 
Hassan. She frankly started exploring something related to her opinion 
about the war: 

"war has brought nothing but misery…………… My mother used to 
force Hassan to hide his gun in an isolated room in my grandfather' 
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house. The gun was disgusting. We hated it. Its sight left us a kind of 
blight and fear. My father had a gun but it was different from my 
brother’s. We did not like our father’s gun but we respected it. Even my 
mother used to clean it every Friday…………. However, Hassan’s gun 
was neither a part of my family nor of our emotion. Although it did not 
bring us misery but it was a witness upon it” P: 129 

It is clear that Iman’s role in the novel is to convey the author’s mission 
which is to spread peace and love. She hates the war and why people 
are indulged in the war, too. She assumes that the reason of going to the 
war are inadequate. Thus, the elements of allusions help the writer to 
pave the way for establishing peace and love.  

The language and the form of narration 

The novel is narrated by using letters correspondence between 
Ghafoory and Iman. It is considered as an epistolary novel in which 
honesty of  narration is a primary aspect of truth which gives the novel 
a kind of reality and power over the place, time and social status that 
surrounds the characters and events. 

There is an enough space for the narration to spell out the freedom of 
self-expression. This space reflects the smoothness of mood, deep 
vitality and vigour of spirit. All these are well employed by the author 
to reveal a sense of dramatic influence over the characters themselves. 
For example, the character of Iman becomes the writer himself of the 
events as if she is surrounding with a form of dramatic monologue.  

As an important technological device, social media has its own effect 
on the form of narration which reflects deeply and clearly the spirit of 
the nation. Iman expresses this feeling through her Facebook account 
which adds a kind of civilized feature to the characters who belong to a 
rural area such as Sa’ada. Iman succeeds to show how women are 
confined by unfair social habits and inequitable customs that deprive 
them even from the slightest rights to live as humans such as education. 
Iman tells the story of war that attacks the city and how it destroys the 
villages and kills people leaving negative impact upon the coming 
generations. 

Although, the period of correspondence does not take a long time in the 
ladder of narration almost two months, the 4

th
 of February to 21

st
 of 

March during the year 2014, the novelist succeeds to reflect a long time 
of the character’s life. He devotes an obvious importance to Iman and 
never gives deep attention to the revolution of 2011. The writer 
distinctly wants to manifest how humanity is more important than 
revolution.  

Ghafoory’s language is bitter which directs its attack as a weapon 
against the living culture that looks down on the others and it is used as 
a tool for revealing the voice of woman which is magnified through the 
character of Iman. The author provides Iman with some skills to 
observe her environment and picture her life with the masters vividly. 
He uses the character of Iman to judge critically the masters and show 
how they think. 
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The novelist describes Iman as capable of being independent against 
the laws of the masters. He uses direct description which make Iman a 
living and strong character. The language is also simple, sincere and it 
has a profound kind of honesty.  

Iman is the main narrator of the story and therefore, the novelist 
passionately identifies himself with Iman using the first person point of 
view. He employs a strong imagination to give her personal freedom. 
Therefore, Iman narrates her story in a atmosphere of rebellion against 
the harsh thoughts and norms of the masters. She despises them with a 
considerable feeling of humanity in order to gain the sympathy of the 
readers on her story. Consequently, the readers does not only believe 
the story but he also deals with Iman as if she were alive. 

By using honesty of narration and personal attachment, the novelist has 
successfully condemned the colours and the social settings that Iman 
lives in. The language does not only criticize but leads the reader into a 
kind of investigation about the reasons and the purposes of using 
religion by the masters. In fact, the novelist has succeeded to reveal 
how religion is condemned by showing the masters’ social and human 
follies. 

Moreover, the language is developed as the story progresses. Iman’s 
use of language is improved as the story moves on. She is described as 
a soldier who needs his tools to continue his journey. Similarly, Iman’s 
language becomes bitter as she uses sharp words to attack the masters. 
She becomes a revolutionary character to repel independently against 
the religious misconceptions which are used to attack the others.  

On the other hand, the language of the masters is another important 
aspect which shows how people's minds are controlled. Iman comments 
that the people who pray feel happy when they heard the phrase: 
"protecting its borders" referring to the Islamic nation. In other words, 
the preacher uses complicated classical Arabic so that people do not 
know the depth of that phrase because most of them are illiterate and 
they cannot reach the real meaning. The speech is beyond their 
linguistic abilities except from some promoting phrases such as 
"protecting its borders" that are used to stimulate people to go to the 
battlefield. Iman comments that by the end of the speech, we know that 
we have to send our men to the battle. She adds: 

“The rest of the speech was very eloquent that we could not even grasp 
or remember." P:95 

The language is used for some political purposes which clearly means 
to participate in the battlefield either by sending army men or 
mujahedeen or any kind of support. 

Conclusion 

This paper has investigated the elements of narration used by 
Ghafoory’s Sa’ada’s Braids to reflect the concept of others that has 
been established by the attitudes of the masters in Sa’ada. The masters 
have utilized religion for their worldly purposes. Ghafoory has 
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criticized the way the masters’ way of dealing with the others by 
creating Iman as an independent character who has revolted against the 
radical rules used by the masters and their harsh ways of controlling 
people’s life.  

The reasons why people are distracted from the reality and why they 
follow their masters blindly without even trying to investigate its truth 
are clearly analysed. Ghafoory’s Sa’ada’s Braids reflects the heroine 
Iman with an independent identity. She shows intelligence, wit, charms 
and liveliness in dealing with the problems of her society.  

Ghafoory narrates his novel by criticizing the continuous regulations 
and conventions of the masters in Sa’ada. The novel emphasizes how 
masters-dominated belief underestimates the life of the others. Their 
belief has deprived the others from their life. Moreover, the masters 
have utilized religion to ridicule the others’ ability to live or understand 
the purpose of their life. However, Ghafoory has not lost the hope of 
preserving humanity and therefore, he has created the character of 
Iman. He has shed light to the idea of hopefulness which is manifested 
by the idea of humanity. In other words, humanity cannot be achieved 
without understanding the purpose of life. 

There is also the element of the setting which helps to achieve the 
purpose of the novelist. The description of places in Sa’ada such as the 
abandoned villages, evacuated houses, high mountains, pilotless 
aircraft and deserted schools provide a suitable setting to show the 
ugliness of the masters’ ideas when they practice them.   

Apart from using the elements of environment, entangling symbols are 
manipulated in such away to picture the consequences of applying the 
rules of the masters. In order to achieve that, Ghafoory symbolically 
depicts the names of the characters, their behavior, and dialogue to 
deepen the dilemma caused by the masters and their beliefs. He has 
successfully reflected the dark shadow perspectives of these rules.  

Moreover, the element of allusions is used particularly in the first part 
of the novel to add real significance and historical attitudes to the 
heroine of the novel. The reader is left with the impression of being 
logically convinced with the real problem and catastrophe Iman has 
been surrounded by. She has been crowned by a sense of gravity and 
seniority when she is attached with historical figures such as Robinson 
Crusoe or Albringo, …. etc.  In other words, the character of Iman has 
been globalized and developed to comprehend the reality around her. 

The presentation of Iman is also used to support Ghafoory’s search for 
humanity and love. Iman becomes the symbol of love and humanity. In 
order to achieve that, she is provided with the element of independence 
and courage.  She is pictured as a healthy character who is courageous 
enough to express her thoughts, face to face with the masters 
themselves.  

Finally, Ghafoory has successfully shown the ugly implications of the 
masters. As a result of the harsh belief and arrogances of the masters, 
people are divided and they become enemies killing each other. 
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Therefore, he has created an amazing character such as Iman to revolt 
against the stupid and ugly belief of the masters. By creating such 
character, Ghafoory has finished the novel with an important message 
that the equality among people should be taken into consideration. He 
inspires people to gain their freedom and voice in such society where 
masters dominate it. Furthermore, he encourages the importance of 
equality between masters and others in the twentieth centuries and 
according to him religion or any other social doctrines should be used 
to help the belief of equality and establish peace. 
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